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Kemps Prime can run onsite or be offered as a cloud based service.  

PRIME OFFICE 16

Prime Office uses Microsoft SQL server to store data and Microsoft Office Access as a
source of forms, reports, queries and menus. It is the traditional Prime that you are
used to, but with expanded features. If you ran Prime in the past, all your custom
queries, reports, forms and code can be used with little or no modification. Prime 16
also uses more of the power of SQL Server.

Prime Office is installed on your premises and maintained by you.  The optional web
features, online intake, PBI portal and case status work with Prime Office. An online
display of the web version of Prime is available. Prime Office can be set up to run
over the web using remote desktop technology.

PRIME CLOUD runs on the web and is an outsourcing of case management. Prime
Cloud combines the flexibility of Prime Office with a web based version. You can
choose to use the standard Office version, the Web version or let different users use
different versions. Prime Cloud is hosted in a high security, Tier 3 data center run by
Venture Technologies. It is an outsourcing of your case management needs.
Security, backup, access and 24/7 connection assistance is provided. Current
options include the Client Online Intake, the PBI Lawyer Portal and the Client Case
Status apps.

Contact Info:

Main Office: 404-320-7126

Secondary Office: 404-636-7767

Website: kempscaseworks.com

http://www.kempscaseworks.com/
http://kempscaseworks.com


Email Contact: Billing tomira@kempscaseworks.com , Support: 
Support@kempscaseworks.com

User Ratings: Coming soon.  Please help us improve these pages by providing
conifdential feedback on these and aother CMS: CMS Rating Survey

Prime 16 Interface:

Video Intro Demo 2012 - This video shows basic features.  The whole itnerface has
been redone recent.  
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Call for Speakers: Project Management, Second Chance Conference Sessions, and
More

LSNTAP is planning our training sessions for 2025 and would like to hear from…
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Resources for Supporting Child Victims & Witnesses Available

Passing along this message from the Center for Justice Innovation (https://www…
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