
LSNTAP Announces Access to
Comprehensive Technology Initiative
Grants Database

Ypsilanti, MI – October 10, 2024 – Legal Services National Technology Assistance
Project (LSNTAP), an organization providing technology education and resources for
legal aid and non-profit legal service providers, is thrilled to announce the launch of
the full version of our comprehensive Technology Initiative Grants (TIG) database.
The full database is now available on our website.

 

The Technology Initiative Grants, awarded by the Legal Services Corporation (LSC),
have been instrumental in advancing technology in the legal aid sector. Our
database includes detailed information on all TIG awards, providing invaluable
insights and resources for legal service providers, researchers, and policymakers.
Also included in the database is information on Technology Improvement Project
(TIP) grants.

 

Key Features of the Database:

Comprehensive Coverage: Includes all TIG and TIP awards from the past 25 years.

Detailed Information: Each entry provides in-depth details about the grant, including
project descriptions, target audience, legal issue addressed, and funding amounts.
As the research continues, the database will expand to include outcomes and major
advances.



User-Friendly Interface: Easy-to-navigate design and filtering ensures quick access
to information.

“We are excited to offer this expanded resource to the legal aid community,” said
Shellie Reid, Manager of LSNTAP. “By making the full TIG database available, we aim
to support innovation and collaboration in the legal services field, ultimately
enhancing access to justice for all.”

 

The full version of the TIG database is now available at https://bit.ly/TIGData. We
invite all legal aid organizations, researchers, and interested parties to explore this
valuable resource.

 

For more information, please contact: Shellie Reid, Manager, Legal Services National
Technology Assistance Project (LSNTAP), (734) 714-3240.

About LSNTAP Legal Services National Technology Assistance Project (LSNTAP) is
part of the Michigan Advocacy Program, a legal aid organization that provides
access to the justice system for those who need it the most through direct legal help
and statewide advocacy. LSNTAP helps nonprofit legal aid organizations improve
client services through effective and innovative use of technology. To do this, we
provide technology training, maintain information, create online tools, and host
community forums.
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